A
BILL
further to amend the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Ministers
(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act,
1975 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. IV of 1975), for the purposes
hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:

1. Short title and commencement.---(1) This Act may be
called the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Privileges) (Amendment) Act, 2014.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No.
IV of 1975.---In the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Ministers (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act
No. IV of 1975), hereinafter referred to as said Act, the existing
section 3 shall be re-numbered as sub-section (1) of section 3 and in
sub-section (1) as so amended, for the words “twenty-one thousand”
and “eighteen thousand”, the words “forty thousand” and “thirty-five
thousand” shall respectively be substituted and after sub-section (1),
as so amended, the following new sub-section shall be added,
namely:

“(2) The salary and other emoluments of Ministers shall
automatically be increased by Government in proportion
increase to be made in the salary of the civil servants in BPS-
20 from time to time.”.

3. Amendment of section 5 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No.
IV of 1975.---In the said Act, in section 5, for the words “ten
thousand” and “six thousand”, the words “twenty thousand” and
“fifteen thousand” shall respectively be substituted.

4, Amendment of section 8 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No.
IV of 1975.---In the said Act, in section 8,-

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “one hundred
thousand”, the words “five hundred thousand”
shall be substituted; and

(i) in sub-section (3) and (4), for the words “fifty-
five thousand”, the words “seventy thousand”
shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 10 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act
No. IV of 1975.---In the said Act, in section 10, in sub-section (1),
for the words “three hundred thousand”, the words “five hundred
thousand” shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 11 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act
No. IV of 1975.---In the said Act, in section 11, for the words” four
hundred and fifty”, the words “one thousand” shall be substituted.



7. Insertion of section 12A to Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No.
IV of 1975.---In the said Act, after section 12, the following new
section shall be inserted, namely:

“12A. Discretionary grant.---A Minister shall be entitled to

receive a discretionary grant at the rate of three hundred
thousand per year.

MINISTER-IN-CHARGE.



