
SUMMARY OF PROCEEDINGS 

FRIDAY, THE 27TH SEPTEMBER, 2019 

  

Proceedings of the House commenced with recitation from the Holy Quran followed by its Urdu 
translation at 10:30 A.M. Mr. Mushtaq Ahmad Ghani, Speaker, Provincial Assembly was in the 
chair. 

 2. QUESTION HOUR. The following questions relating to Food, Energy & Power, Higher 
Education, Archives & Libraries and Elementary & Secondary Education Departments were 
taken up for answers,- 

 i. Nos. 2443, 2430, 2494 and 2496, replied. 

ii. No. 322 was lapsed due to the absence of the mover. 

iii. Nos. 2447 and 2448 were deferred. 

iii. Nos. 2431, 2488, 2479, 2755, 2756, 2742, 2806 and 2807 replies were laid on table under 
rule 38. 

 ·         A letter to the Chief Secretary regarding absence of Secretaries or 

Representatives of certain administrative departments.                            To be issued by 

                                                                                                                    Chamber Officer. 

 3.  LEAVE APPLICATIONS. The House granted leave to the following Honorable Members:- 

 i. Mufti Ubaid-Ur-Rehman, MPA                                               (27th September, 2019)             

ii. Hafiz Asam ud Din, MPA                                                      (27th September, 2019) 

iii. Syed Ahmad Hussain Shah, MPA                                        (27th September, 2019) 

iv. Ms. Nadia Sher, MPA                                                          (27th September, 2019) 

v. Engineer Fahim Ahmad Khan, MPA                                    (27th September, 2019) 

vi. Ms. Samar Haroon Bilour, MPA                                           (27th September, 2019) 

vii. Ms. Momina Basit, MPA                                                     (27th September, 2019) 

viii. Ms. Zinat Bibi, MPA                                                                        (27th September, 2019) 



ix. Mr. Fazal Hakeem Khan, MPA                                             (27th September, 2019) 

x. Haji Anwar Hayat Khan, MPA                                              (27th September, 2019) 

xi. Mr. Jamshid Khan Mohmand, MPA                                                (27th September, 2019) 

xii. Mr. Tufail Anjum, MPA                                                       (27th September, 2019) 

xiii. Mr. Taj Muhammad Khan, MPA                                         (27th September, 2019) 

xiv. Mr. Nazir Ahmad Abbasi, MPA                                         (27th September, 2019) 

  

4. CALL ATTENTION NOTICES. The following Call Attention Notices were taken up,- 

 i. No. 485 of Sahibzada Sanaullah, MPA. A Special Committee would be constituted by the 
Honorable Speaker in consultation of the Government and the Opposition. 

           Debates to be Consulted 

 ii. No. 561 of Ms. Ayesha Banno, MPA. Mr. Shahram Khan, Minister for Local Government 
made statement on it. 

 5. INTRODUCTION OF THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA ENFORCEMENT OF 
WOMEN’S PROPERTY RIGHTS BILL, 2019. Mr. Sultan Muhammad Khan, Minister for Law 
introduced the above captioned Bill in the House. 

 6. CONSIDERATION AND PASSAGE OF THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA EMPLOYEES 
OF TRANSPORT AND MASS TRANSIT DEPARTMENT (REGULARIZATION OF 
SERVICES) BILL, 2019. Upon the motions of Mr. Sultan Muhammad Khan, Minister for Law 
the above captioned Bill was considered clause by clause and passed by the House. 

7. CONSIDERATION AND PASSAGE OF THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA REGIONAL 
AND DISTRICT HEALTH AUTHORITIES BILL, 2019. As an additional agenda item, upon 
the motions of Mr. Hasham Inamullah Khan, Minister for Health, the above captioned Bill was 
considered clause by clause and passed by the House with the amendments in the following 
clauses,- 

 i. Amendments of Minister for Health in clause 5, in sub-clauses (6) and (7); 

ii. Amendments of Mr. Inayatullah, MPA in clause 7, in sub-clauses (1) and (7); 

iii. Amendments of Ms. Sobia Shahid, MPA in clauses 15 and 23. 

  



8. LAYING OF THE REPORT ON 2ND BIANNUAL MONITORING ON THE 
IMPLEMENTATION OF NFC AWARD (JANUARY-JUNE, 2018). Mr. Sultan Muhammad 
Khan, Minister for Law laid the above captioned report in the House. 

 9. TIME EXTENTION, PRESENTATION AND ADOPTATION OF THE REPORT OF 
SPECIAL COMMITTEE ON (ETEA). Upon the motions of Mr. Sultan Muhammad Khan, 
Minister for Law/Chairman of the Special Committee on Educational Testing and Evaluation 
Agency (ETEA), the House extended time period for presentation of report of the said 
Committee and thereafter the report was presented and adopted. 

 10. DISCUSSION ON LOW ELECTRICITY VOLTAGE, LOAD SHEDING OF 
ELECTRICITY & GAS AND NET HYDEL PROFIT. The following Honorable Members took 
part in the discussion,- 

 i. Mr. Akram Khan Durrani, Leader of Opposition 

ii. Mr. Mir Kalam Khan, MPA 

iii. Sardar Hussain Babak, MPA 

iv. Mr. Waqar Ahmad Khan, MPA 

 ·      Mr. Shaukat Yousafzai, Minister for Information concluded the discussion. 

 11. RESOLUTIONS. In suspension of Rule 124 under rule 240, the House unanimously adopted 
resolution notice no. 372 of Mr. Shah Muhammad, MPA whereas Mr. Waqar Ahmed Khan, 
MPA moved resolution no. 332   in the House but it was not put to vote due to lack of quorum. 

 12. DUE TO WANT OF QUORUM, THE SITTING WAS ADJOURNED TILL 2:00 P.M OF 
MONDAY, THE 30th SEPTEMBER, 2019. 

 


