
SUMMARY OF PROCEEDINGS OF FRIDAY, THE 3RD SEPTEMBER, 2021 

Proceedings of the House commenced with recitation from the Holy Quran followed by its Urdu translation 
at 11:05 A.M. Mr. Mahmood Jan, Deputy Speaker, Provincial Assembly was in the chair. 

2. QUESTION HOUR. The following questions relating to Higher Education and Energy and Power 
Departments were taken-up for answers,- 

i. No. 12708 was replied. 

ii. Nos. 12604 and 13130  were called but the movers were absent(Replies received, circulated and deem 
tabled). 

iii. No.12840 was referred to the Standing Committee on Higher Education for examination of record in 
respect of appointments made in Grade 7 to 11 by the Department and in Grade 14 to 19 by the Public 
Service Commission during tenure of the present Government. 

3. LEAVE APPLICATIONS. The House granted leave for 3rd September, 2021 to the following Honorable 
Members,- 

i.  Mr. Shafiq Sher Afridi 

ii. Ms. Maria Fatima 

iii. Mr. Faisal Amin Gandapure 

iv. Mr. Azizullah 

v. Nawabzada Farid Salah ud din 

vi.Ms. Momina Basit 

vii. Mr. Bilawal Afridi 

viii. Ms. Sajida Hanif 

ix. Mr. Muhammad Arif 

x. Mr. Shakeel Ahmed 

xi. Mr. Ziaullah Bangash(From 28th August to 10th September 2021) 

xii. Mr. Shahram Khan Tarakai 

xiii. Mr. Faisal Zaman 

xiv.Mr. Mohibullah Khan 

xv. Said Fakher Jehan 

xvi. Mr. Muhammad Iqbal Wazir 

xvii. Mr. Khaliq ur Rahman 

xviii. Mr. Sardar Khan 

xix. Mr. Bahadur Khan 

 The Chair directed to remove Attendance Register from the House at the expiration of first 
hour of the commencement of every sitting.  

4. ADJOURNMENT MOTION. Adjournment Motion No. 343 of Mr. Ikhtiar Wali, MPA was moved and 
admitted for detail discussion. 



5. CALL ATTENTION NOTICE. The following Call Attention Notices were taken-up,- 

i. Notice No. 1977 of Mr. Bahadur Khan, MPA was called but lapsed due to absence of its mover. 

ii. Notice No. 2088 of Malik Badshah Saleh, MPA was raised and referred to Standing Committee on 
Communication & Works Department. 

6. INTRODUCTION OF KHYBER PAKHUNTKHWA UNIVERSITIES (SECOND AMENDMENT) BILL, 
2021(N0.180). Mr. Kamran Khan Bangash, Special Assistant to Chief Minister for Higher Education, 
introduced the above-captioned Bill in the House. 

7. INTRODUCTION OF KHYBER PAKHUNTKHWA LOCAL GOVERNMENT (THIRD AMENDMENT) 
BILL, 2021. Mr. Kamran Khan Bangash, Special Assistant to Chief Minister for Higher Education, 
introduced the above-captioned Bill in the House as an additional agenda item. 

8. CONSIDERATION AND PASSAGE OF KHYBER PAKHUNTKHWA UNIVERSITIES (AMENDMENT) 
BILL, 2021(N0.177).Upon the motions of Mr. Kamran Khan Bangash, Special Assistant to Chief Minister 
for Higher Education, the above-captioned Bill considered clause by clause and passed by the House. 

9. CONSIDERATION & PASSAGE OF THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA WITNESS PROTECTION BILL, 
2021. Upon the motions of Mr. Shaukat Yousafzai, Minister for Parliamentary Affairs and Labour, the above-
captioned Bill was considered clause by clause by the House and passed with the amendments in the 
following clauses,- 

i. in clause 8 as moved by Ms. Nighat Yasmin Orakzai, MPA 

ii. in clause 15 as moved by Ms. Naeema Kishwar, MPA 

iii. in clause 18 as moved by Ms. Nighat Yasmin Orakzai, MPA 

10. LAYING OF THE ANNUAL REPORT OF THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA REVENUE AUTHORITY 
FOR THE YEAR 2019-20. Mr. Shaukat Yousafzai, Minister for Parliamentary Affairs and Labour laid in the 
House the above-captioned Report on behalf of the Minister for Finance. 

11. PRIVATE MEMBER’S RESOLUTION. In suspension of rules, a joint resolution Notice No. 1471 moved 
by Mr. Inayatullah, MPA was passed unanimously by the House. 

12. DISCUSSION UNDER RULE 73 ON ADJOURNMENT MOTION NO. 333 OF MR. INAYATULLAH, 
MPA. Discussion on the above captioned motion was commenced and the following Honorable Members 
participated in it,- 

i. Mr. Inayatullah 

ii. Mr. Mir Kalam Khan Wazir 

iii. Mr. Khushdil Khan 

iv. Mr. Salah ud din 

v. Ms. Nighat Yasmin Orakzai 

vi. Sardar Hussain Babak 

vii. Hafiz Assam ud din 

 FURTHER DISCUSSION ON THE MOTION WAS DEFERRED BY THE CHAIR FOR NEXT 
SITTING. 

13. THE SITTING WAS ADJOURNED TILL 10:00 A.M OF FRIDAY, THE 10TH SEPTEMBER, 2021. 

 


