EXTRAORDINARY REGISTERED NO. RIll

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA
Published by Authority

PESHAWAR, THURSDAY, 5™ DECEMBER, 2019.

GOVERNMENT OF THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA,
LAW, PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND HUMAN RIGHTS
DEPARTMENT.

NOTIFICATION

Dated Peshawar, the 5™/ December, 2019.

No. LEGIS: 1(14)1973.--- The following Ordinance by the Governor of the
Khybgr Pakhtunkhwa is hereby published for general information:

THE KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA FINANCE
(AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2019.

(KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA ORD. NO. VII OF 2019)

AN
ORDINANCE .

further to amend the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa
Finance Act, 2010

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Finance

Act, 2D10 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. VIIT of 2010), for the purposes hereinafter
appeating;

AND WHEREAS the Provincial Assembly is not in session and the Governor
of the|Province of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa is satisfied that circumstances exist which
render|it necessary to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of powers conferred by Clause (1) of
Articlg 128 of the Constitution of Islamic Republic of Pakistan, the Governor of the

398




= T

3d9  KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA GOVT: GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY. 5 DECEMBER, 2019

P1 ovi_ncé 'ofl the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa is pleased to make and promulgate the
ffllowing Ordinance:

5 .Short title and commencement.-—(1) This Ordinance may be called the
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Finance (Amendment) Ordinance, 2019.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

21  Amendment of section 2 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. VIII of
2010.—In the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Finance Act, 2010 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act
Nb. VIIT of 2010), in section 2, in sub-section (2),-

(a) in clause (a), in the table, against Serial No (i), in column 3, under the
heading “Rate of tax”, for the words “Two percent”, the words “One and a
half percent”, shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), in the table, against Serial No (i), in column 3, under the
heading “Rate of tax”, for the words “Two percent”, the words “One and a
half percent”, shall be substituted; and

(¢) inclause (c), in the table, against Serial No (i), in column 3, under the
heading “Rate of tax”, for the figure and symbol “2%”, the words “One and
a half percent”, shall be substituted.

Peshawar, SHAH FARMAN
Dated the 29" November, 2019. Governor of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.
MASOOD AHMAD

Secretary to
Government of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa,
Law, Parliamentary Affairs and
Human Rights Department.

Printed and published by the Manager,
Staty. Ptg. Deptt., Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Pashawar.




