A
Bill

further to amend the laws relating to the
Salaries and Allowances of Members of the
Provincial Assembly of the Province of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa
and Salaries, Allowances and Privileges of the Speaker and
Deputy Speaker’s of the Province of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Provincial Assembly

of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Province (Salaries and Allowances of Members)
Act, 1974 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act, No.XI of 1974) and the Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa Province Speaker and Deputy Speaker’s (Salaries, Allowances
and Privileges) Act,1975 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act, No. III of 1975), for the

purposes hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:

1. Short title and commencement.---(1) This Act may be called the
C}YI £ Khyber Pakhtunkhwa (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) laws (Amendment)
: A~
(5/, /,)\ Act, 2022.
(2) It shall come into force at once, and shall be deemed to have taken
effect from the 1% July, 2022.
2. Amendment of certain laws.---The laws specified in column No-3 of

the Schedule append to this Act shall be amended to the extent and in the

\ manner specified against each in column No-4 of the said Schedule.

SCHEDULE
(See section 2)
S.No. | Number and Short title. Amendments.
year of the
enactment.

1. y 3. 4.

1. | Khyber The Provincial . In section 3, for the words
iil:hNo XIw o Aslsfhn;gg_ o “eighty thousand” the words
of 1974. Pakhtunkhwa “one hundred and Afifty

(Silr:;i/:;c:n d thousand” and for the words
Allowances of “Ten thousand” the words
Memlbgcgz) £, “gighteen thousand seven

hundred and fifty” shall be

substituted respectively.




10.

In section 4(3), for the
words “one lac and twenty
thousand” the words “two
lac and twenty five
thousand” shall be
substituted.

In section 5, for the words
“one hundred and fifty” the
words “two thousand” shall
be substituted.

In section 7, in the first
proviso, for the words “ten
thousand” the words “eighteen
thousand seven hundred and
fifty” shall be substituted.

In section 7A, for the words
“ten thousand” the words
“eighteen  thousand seven

hundred and fifty”. Shall be
substituted.

In section 7B, for the words
“one thousand and six
hundred” the words “three
thousand and two hundred”
shall be substituted.

In section 7C, for the words
“four thousand and eight
hundred” the words “nine
thousand” shall be substituted.
In section 7D, for the words
“thirty thousand” the words
“fifty six thousand two
hundred and fifty” shall be
substituted.

In section 8, for the words
“nine thousand” the words
“sixteen  thousand  eight
hundred and seventy five”
shall be substituted.

In section 10, for the word
“one thousand” the word “two

thousand” shall be substituted.




11.

12.

Insertion of new section
“10A Constituency
Assistance Allowance”. A
member shall be entitled to
receive constituency
assistance allowance at the
rate of fifty thousand rupees
per month.

Insertion of new section
“10B Orderly Allowance”.
A member shall be entitled
to receive Orderly
Allowance at the rate of
Twenty one thousand rupees

per month.

Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa
Act No. III of
1975,

The Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa
Province
Speaker’s and
Deputy
Speaker’s
(Salaries,
Allowances and
Privileges Act,
1975.

13.

14.

&

16.

11

In section 3, for the words
“one lac and fifty thousand”
the word “two lac eighty
one thousand two hundred
and fifty” shall be
substituted.

In section 5, for words
“twenty  thousand” the
words “thirty seven
thousand five hundred” shall
be substituted.

In section 7(3), for the
words “Seventy thousand”
the words “one lac thirty
one thousand two hundred
and  fifty” shall be
substituted.

In section 13, for the word
“two thousand” the word
“four  thousand  eight
hundred” shall be
substituted.

In section 14A, for the
words “two lac” the words
“three lac seventy five
thousand” shall be
substituted.




18.

19.

20.

21.

22,

23,

In section 14B, for the
word “Eighteen
Thousand” the word
“Thirty Three Thousand
Seven Hundred and Fifty”
shall be substituted.
Insertion of new section
“17A Constituency
Assistance Allowance”.
The Speaker shall be
entitled to receive
constituency  assistance
allowance at the rate of
fifty thousand rupees per
month.

Insertion of new section
“17B orderly
allowarse”. The Speaker
shall be entitled to receive
Orderly allowance at the
rate of Twenty one
thousand  rupees  per
month.

In section 18, for the
words “one lac and forty
five thousand” the words
“two lac seventy one
thousand eight hundred
and seventy five” shall be
substituted.

In section 19A, for the
word “Ten thousand” the
word “Eighteen thousand
seven hundred and fifty”
shall be substituted.

In section 20(4), for the
word “Fifty five
thousand” the word “one
lac three thousand one
hundred and twenty five”
shall be substituted.




24.

25;

26.

21,

28.

In section 25, for the
words “Seven hundred
and fifty” the words
“Four thousand” shall be
substituted.

In section 25A, for the
words “one lac fifty
thousand” the words
“two lac eighty one
thousand two hundred
and fifty” shall be
substituted.

In section 25B, for the
words “Fifteen
thousand” the words
“Twenty eight thousand
one hundred and twenty
five” shall be
substituted.

Insertion of new
section “26A,
constituency assistance
allowance”. The Deputy
Speaker shall be entitled
to receive Constituency
Assistance Allowance at
the rate of fifty thousand
rupees per month.
Insertion of new
section “26B, orderly
allowance”. The Deputy
Speaker shall be entitled
to  receive  orderly
allowance at the rate of
twenty one thousand

rupees per month.




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASIONS

It is desirable to enhance the Salaries and Allowances of Speaker,

Deputy Speaker and Members of the Provincial Assembly of the Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa. Hence, this Bill.

MEMBER-INCHARGE
Pesh e e
eshawar ] = :
Dated __ /10/2022 G/';) l ‘—:’W‘P




