EXTRAORDINARY REGISTERED NO. Pl

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

KHYBEB PAKHTUNKHWA
Published by Authority

PESHAWAR, WEDNESDAY, 9TH JANUARY, 2013.

" PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT KHYBER
" PAKHTUNKHWA

NOTIFICATION
Dated Peshawar, the 9th January, 2013.

No. PA/Khyber Pakhtunkhwa/Bills/2013/754.— The Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Standard

Weights and Measures Enforcement (Amendment) Bill, 2012 having been passed by the
Provincial Assembly of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa on 21st December, 2012 and assented to by the

Governor of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa on 7th January, 2013 is hereby published as an Act of the
Provincial Legislature of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.

THE KHYBER APAKI-H'UNKHWA STANDARD WEIGHTS AND MEASURES
ENFORCEMENT (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2012

(KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA ACTNO. 1 OF 20 13)
(First pub/lshed after having rece/ved the assent of the Governor of the
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa in the Gazette of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa,
(Extraordinary), dated the 9th January, 2013).

AN
ACT

to amend the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Standard Weights and Measures
: Enforcement Act, 1976.

Preamble.---WHEREAS it is expedient to yamend the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Standard
Weights and Measures Enforcement Act, 1976, for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Itis hereby enacted as follows:

478

g



479 KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, 9th JANUARY, 2013

1. Short title and commencement.---(1) This Act may be called the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa
Standard Weights and Measures Enforcement (Amendment) Act, 2012.

(2)  Itshall come into force at once.

2.  Amendment of section 26 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. il of 1976.---In the
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Standard Weights and Measures Enforcement Act, 1976, (Act No. ill of
1976), hereinafter referred to the said Act, in section 26,-

(a) in sub-section (1) for the word “two”, the word “twenty shall be
substituted, and

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “one thousand and five hundred
rupees”, the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 27 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. Il of 1976.---In the said
Act, in section 27, for the word “two”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 28 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. Ill of 1976.---In the said
Act, in section 28, for the word “two”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 29 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. Il of 1976.---In the said
Act, in section 29, for the word “two”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 30 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. Ill of 1976.---In the said
Act, in section 30, for the word “two”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted.

7.  Amendment of section 31 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. Ill of 1976.---In the said
Act, in section 31, for the word “two”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 34 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. lll of 1976.---In the said
Act, in section 34, for the word “two”, the word “thirty” shall be substituted.

9. Amendment of secti‘env 36 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. Il of 1976.---In the said
Act, in section 36, for the words “two thousand and five hundred rupees”, the words “fifty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

10. Insertion of new section 45A in the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. il of 1976.---In the
said Act after section 45, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:

“45A. Act to override other laws.-The provisions of this Act shall have an overriding
effect notwithstanding anything to the contrary contained in any other law for the time
being in force.”.



- KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY, 9th JANUARY, 2013. 480

11. ‘ Amendment of section 46 of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. Il of 1976.---In the said
- Act, in section 46, in sub-section (3), for the word “two”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted.

BY ORDER OF MR. SPEAKER
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF KHYBER
PAKHTUNKHWA

(AMANULLAH)
Secretary,
Provincial Assembly of Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa.

Printed and published by the Manager,
Staty. & Ptg. Deptt., Khyber Pakhtunkhwa, Peshawar



