
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
EXTRAORDINARY REGISTERED NO. P.1I1

. Published by Authority
PESHAWAR, WEDNESDAY, 181M JUN,E, 2014.

PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT,
KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA

NOll FlCAll ON
Dated Peshawar, the 18th June, 2014:

No. PA/Khyber Pakhtunkhwa/BlIIs/2014/19906.-The Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Ministers
(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) (Amendment) Bill, 2014 having been passed by the Provincial
Assembly of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa on 6th June, 2014 and assented to by the Governor of the Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa on 13th June, 2014 is hereby published as an Act of the Provincial Legislature of the

• Khyber Pakhtunkhwa.

llIE KHYBERPAKHi'UNKHWAMINISTERS(SALARIES,ALLOWANCESAND
PRIVILEGES)(AMENPMENl) ACT,2014

(KHYBERPAKH1lJNKHWAACTNO.XXIVOF2014)

(Rrst published after having received the assent of the GoverlJor of the
Khyber Pakhtunkhwa in the Gazette of the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa,

(Extraordinary), dated the 18fhJune" 2014).

AN
.ACT

further to amend the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Ministers
(Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975.

. WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Ministers (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges) Act, ·1975 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. IV of 1975), for the purposes
hereinafter appearing;

It is hereby enacted as follows:

1. . , Short title and commencement---(l) This Act may be called the Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Ministers
(Salaries, AUowances and Privikges) (Amendment) Act, 2014. -

2780



2781 KHYBERPAKHlUNKHWAGOVERNMENTGAZE11E,EXTRAORDINARY,18th JUNE;2014

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 3 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. IV of 1975.---ln the Khyber
Pakhtunkhwa Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No.
IV of 1975), hereinafter referred to as said Act, the existing section 3 shall be re-numbered as sub-
section (1) of section 3and in sub-section (1) as so amended, for the words "twenty-one thousand" and .
"eighteen thousand", the words "forty thousand" and "thirty-five thousand" shall respectively be
substituted and after sub-section (1), as so amended, the following new sub-section shall be added,
namely:

"(2) The salary and other emoluments of Ministers shall automatically be increased by
Government in proportion increase to be made in the salary of the civil servants in BPS-20 from
time to time. ".

3. .Amendment of secUon 5 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Aet No. IV of 1975.---ln. the said Act, in
section 5, forlhe words "ten thousand" and "six thousand", the words "twenty thousand" and "fifteen
thousand" shall respectively be substituted.

4. Amendment of section 8 of Khyber Pakhturlldlwa AetNo. IV of 1975.---ln the said Act, in
section 8,-

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words "one hundred thousand", the words "five
hundred thousand" shall be substituted; and

(ii) in sub-section (3) and (4),.. for the words "fifty-five thousand", the words
"seventy thousand" shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of secUon 10 of Khyber Pakhtunkllwa Aet No. IV of 1975.---ln the said Act, in
section 10, in sub-section (1), for the words "three hundred thousand", the words "five hundred
thousand" shall be substituted. '

8. , Amendment of section 11 of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Aet No. IV of 1975.---ln the said Act, in,
section 11, for the words" four hundred and fifty", the ~ords "one thousand" s~all be substituted.

7. Insertion of section 12A to Khyber Pakhtunkhwa Act No. IV of 1975.---ln the said 'Act, after
section 12, the following new section shall be inserted, namely:

"12A. . Discretlona" grant---A Minister shall be entitled to receive a discretionary grant at the
, rate of three hundred thousand per year.

(AMANULlAH)
Secretary

Provincial Assembly of Khyber Pakhtunkhwa

BY ORDER OF MR. SPEAKER
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF KHYBER PAKHTUNKHWA

PrInted and published by tile ••• ,
StatJ. " Ptg. Deplt., IOIyber Paldltullldlwa, PeshaRr


