EXTRAORDINARY REGISTERED NC. Pl

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE

North-West Frontier Province
j Published by Authority
PESHAWAR, WEDNESDAY, 4TH FEBRUARY, 2009.

PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT,
NORTH-WEST FRONTIER PROVINCE.

NOTIFICATION
Dated Peshawar, the 4th February, 2009.

No. PA/NWFP/Bills/2009/4050.—The North-West Frontier Province Salaries, Allowances
and Privileges Laws (Amendment) Bill, 2009 having been passed by the Provincial Assembly of
North-West Frontier Province on 21st January, 2009 and assented to by the Governcr of the North-
West Frontier Province on 29th January, 2005 is hereby putlished as an Act of the Provincial
Legislature of the North-West Frontier Provincs.

' THE NORTH-WEST FRONTIER PROVINCE
SALARIES, ALLOWANCES AND PRIVILEGES LAWS
(AMENDMENT) ACT, 2009.

(N-W.F.P. ACT NO. IV OF 2009}

(First published after having received the assent of the Gavernor of the
North-West Frontier Province in the Gazette of the N.-W.F.P.
(Extraordinary), dated the 4th February, 2009.

AN
, ACT
further to amend the laws relating to the Salaries ond allowances of the Members
of the Provincial Assembly of the North-West Frontier Provir.ce and Sclaries,
" Allowances and Privileges of the Speaker and Deputy Speaker of the
North-West Frontier Province.

Preamble.— WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Provincial Asseribly of the
North-West Frontier Province (Salaries and Allowances of Members) Act, 1974 ('N.-W.i" P. Act No,
XI of 1974) and the North-West Froxer Province Speaker and Deputy Speaker:: (Salaries,
Allowances and Privileges) Act, 1975 (N.-W.F.P. Act No. TII of 1975), for the purposes hereinafter
appearing;

481

a3

AT TR S N R M NV LA

T ——



i) N.VF.r GOVERNMENT GAZE

TTE. EXTRAORDINARY, 4th FEBRUARY , i

1.

Province Salaties, Allowan

2

It is hereby cnacted as follows:

sitie and commenicement.— (1) T

Short 1]

cas and Privileges Laws (Amendment) Act, 2009.

(2') It shall come into force at once.

his Act may be called the North.\;vest Pig

Amendment of certain laws.— The laws specified in column 3 of the Schedule appengy
me

this Act shall pe amended to the extent and in the manner specified against each in colump 4 of
1S . \ ;
said Schedule.

“SCHEDULE
(See section 2)
SNo. | Numberandyear | oo, Amendments
: cf the enactment
1 2 3 4
1. | N-W.E.P. Act No. The Provincial | 1. In section 3, in sub-section (1), for the Wi
Xiof 1974. Assembly of “eight” and “two”, the word “twelye™ and “ff
the North-West | shall respectively be substituted.
Frontiér Province JUTEh

(Salaries and
Allowances of
Members) Act,
1974,

2. For section 3A, the following  shall
substituted, namely:

“3A.  Facilities for Leader of Oppo
tion.— A membe: who has been declared
Leader of the Oppusition shall be entitled
the Salary, Allowances and Privileges
admissible to the Frovincial Ministers unc
the North-West Frontier Province Minis:
(Salaries, Allowapces and Privileges) .
1975 (N.-W.F.p. ActNo. IV of HOFES) S

2. Insection 4.

(i) in sub-section ( 1),—
(@  in para (a), for the words “t
fare of the class travelled, pe
half fare of the air-conditiom
class”, the words “ope &
conditioned ¢jagg fare” shall |
Substj tuted; and
®) in Para (c), for the word “tw:
the worg “three” shall
substituted;”; and

(i) ‘in sub-section (@)
twenty thoy,
thousang?

for the worm
sand”, the words “for
shal] be substituted.




N.W.F.P. GOVERNMENT GAZFTTE, EXTRAORDINARY. 4th FEBRUARY, 2009. 483

1 2 -3 4
3. In section 7. in the first proviso, for the word
“four”, the word “five” shall be substituted.
4, in section 7-A. for the word “four”, the
. word “ten” shall be substituted.
) 5. After section 7-B. the following new section
7-C shall be inserted, namely:
«7C, Utility Alowance.— A Member shall
be entitled to receive utility allowance at the
rate of three thousand rupees per month.”.
6. In section 10, for the words “six hundred and
fifty”, the words “one thousand” - shall be
substituted.
2, N.-W.F.P. Act No. | The North-West 1. In section 3, for the words “twenty thousand

{11 of 1975.

Frontier Province
Speaker and
Deputy Speaker’s
(Salaries.
Allowances and
Privileges) Act,
1975.

two hundred and fifty rapees”, the words “thirty
thousanc and five hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.

2. In section S5, for the words “six thousand

rupees”. the words “eigat thousand rupees” shall
be substiuted.

3. For section 6, the following shall be
substituted, namely:

“§, Equipment _ allowances of _the
Speaker.— The Speaker on appointment
shal receive equipment allowance of five
thousand rupees, once for tenure of the
Assembly.”.

4. After section 6, the following new section
6A shall be added, namely:

“6A Discretionary grant.—A sum of
rupess five hundred thousand per annum
shal: be placed at the disposal of the Speaker
for making discretionary grants in such
marner as may be prescribed.”.

After section 7, the following new section

n

7A shail be substituted. namely:

“7A. Telephone. The Speaker shall be
entiled at Government expense, to the use of

one ‘elephone at his office and one telephone

e A o T TRt 18 1 1T T 3 DA




_

A n R‘[., 4th FEBRCAR\"’
VERNMENT GAZETTE, EXTRAORD NA 2009l
484 N.W.F.P.GO !

1 2

3

; his residence both for ofﬁcim

. £ unofflcial
use throughout the term of his office. In addiy;

he Speaker shall also be engq. "
Weatove the Sped : itleq
:ﬁehzse of one cellular phone with a by, n0°1

exceeding rupees two thousand per month,”,

6. In section 8, in sub-section (1), in clayg, (i)
fc;r the words “Economy class”‘, the words “firg
or business class” shall be subsmuted..

7. In section 9, in sub-section (1), in cl_ause (),
for sub-clauses (i) and (ii), the following shall
respectively be substituted, namely:

“() an ordinary first class tourist car: or

(i)  two berthed -Air-conditioned firgt
class.”.

0

8. In section 11, in clause (a), for the word
“two™, the word “three” shall be substituted.

9. In section 12, in sub-section (1), for the
words “three hundred thousand™, the words “five
hundred thousand” shall be substituted.

10. In section 13, for the words “four hundred
and fifty mpecs per day”, the words “one
thousand rupees per day” shall be substituted.

L. In section 18, for the words “eighteen
thousand rupees”, the words  “twenty-seven
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

12. After section  19-A,

the following new
section 19-B ang 19-C shall

be added, namely:

“19-B.  Equipment allowance of the
Deputy Speaker.

_ —The Deputy Speaker on
appointment  ghg]) i

‘19-C, Discretionayy rant.—A sum of
Iupees t}

ree hundreq thousand per annum

;hall be placed a the disposal of the Deputy
peaker for making discretionary grants in
ay be rescribed.”.

Such manner asm

—

——



LRSS

N.W.F.P. GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EXTRAORDINARY. 4th FEBRUARY. 2009. 485

e

T 2 : 3 3

13. In section 20, in sub-secti;)ns (3) and (4), for
the words “sixteen thousand rupees”, the words
“thirty-five thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

14. After section 20, the following new section
20A shall be added, namely:

“20A. Telephone.—The Deputy Speaker
shall be entitled at Government expense. to
the use of one telephone at his office and one
telephone at his residence ‘both for official
and unofficial use throughout the term of his
office. In addition to the above the Deputy
Speaker shall also be entitled to the use of
one cellular phone with a bill not exceeding
rupees two thousand per month.”.

15. In section 21, in sub-section (1), in sub-
clause (i), for the words “economy class”, the
words “first or business class” shall be
substituted.

16. In section 24, in clause (a). for the words
“one rupee and twenty paisa”, the words “three
rupees” shall be substituted.

17. In section 24A, in sub-section (1). for the
words "“three hundred thousand™", the words “five
hundred thousand” shall be substituted.

18. In section 25, for the words “four hundred
and fifty per day”. the words “seven hundred and
fifty per day” shall be substituted.”.

BY ORDER OF MR. SPEAKER,
PROVINCIAL ASSEMBLY OF
NORTH-WEST FRONTIER PROVINCE.

MUHAMMAD SALIM KiAN
Secretary,
Provincial Assembly of N.W.F.P.

inted and published by Il;\e Manager,
Pn:m_v. & Ptg. Deptt.. NWFP, Pesh.




